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DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for an additional 30 
days until December 31, 2014. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have additional comments, 
suggestions, or need a copy of the 
proposed information collection 
instrument with instructions or 
additional information, please contact 
C. Casto at 1–202–353–7193, Bureau of 
Justice Assistance, Office of Justice 
Programs, U.S. Department of Justice, 
810 7th Street NW., Washington, DC 
20531 or by email at Chris.Casto@
usdoj.gov. 

Written comments and/or suggestions 
can also be directed to the Office of 
Management and Budget, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Attention Department of Justice Desk 
Officer, Washington, DC 20530 or sent 
to OIRA_submissions@omb.eop.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Bureau of Justice 
Statistics, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Evaluate whether and if so how the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected can be 
enhanced; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

1. Type of Information Collection: 
Extension of currently approved 
collection. 

2. The Title of the Form/Collection: 
State Criminal Alien Assistance 
Program 

3. The agency form number, if any, 
and the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
None. Bureau of Justice Assistance, 
Office of Justice Programs, United States 
Department of Justice. 

4. Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: 

Primary: Eligible state, local, or tribal 
agency that has authority over 
correctional facilities and incurred costs 
related to detaining certain categories of 
undocumented criminal aliens and the 
costs associated with the housing said 
aliens covered by the SCAAP law. 

Abstract: In response to the Violent 
Crime Control and Law Enforcement 
Act of 1994 Section 130002(b) as 
amended in 1996, the Office of Justice 
Programs’ (OJP) Bureau of Justice 
Assistance (BJA) administers the State 
Criminal Alien Assistance Program 
(SCAAP) with the U.S. Immigration and 
Customs Enforcement (ICE), a 
component of the Department of 
Homeland Security (DHS). SCAAP 
provides federal payments to states and 
localities that incurred correctional 
officer salary costs for incarcerating 
undocumented criminal aliens with at 
least one felony or two misdemeanor 
convictions for violations of state or 
local law, and who are incarcerated for 
at least 4 consecutive days during the 
designated reporting period. SCAAP is 
governed by Section 242 of the 
Immigration and Nationality Act, 8 
U.S.C. 1231(i), as amended, and Title II, 
Subtitle C, Section 20301, Violent Crime 
Control and Law Enforcement Act of 
1994, Public Law 103–322. 

5. An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: It is estimated that no more 
than 887 respondents will apply each 
year. Each application takes 
approximately 90 minutes to complete. 

6. An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: An estimate of the total 
public burden (in hours) associated with 
the collection is 1,330.50 hours. Total 
Annual Reporting Burden: 887 × 1.5 
hours per application = 1,330.50. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Jerri Murray, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE., 3E.405B, 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: November 25, 2014. 

Jerri Murray, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2014–28207 Filed 11–28–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–18–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

[OMB Number 1140–0010] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed eCollection 
eComments Requested; Application To 
Transport Interstate or Temporarily 
Export Certain National Firearms Act 
(NFA) Firearms 

AGENCY: Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, 
Firearms and Explosives, Department of 
Justice. 
ACTION: 60-day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Justice 
(DOJ), Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, 
Firearms and Explosives (ATF), will 
submit the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
The proposed information collection is 
published to obtain comments from the 
public and affected agencies. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 60 days until 
January 30, 2015. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have additional comments 
especially on the estimated public 
burden or associated response time, 
suggestions, or need a copy of the 
proposed information collection 
instrument with instructions or 
additional information, please contact 
Andrew Ashton, National Firearms Act 
Branch at nfaombcomments@atf.gov . 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 

• Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

• Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

• Evaluate whether and if so how the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected can be 
enhanced; and 

• Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
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e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of this information 
collection 1140–0010: 

1. Type of Information Collection: 
Extension without change of an existing 
collection. 

2. The Title of the Form/Collection: 
Application to Transport Interstate or 
Temporarily Export Certain National 
Firearms Act (NFA) Firearms. 

3. The agency form number, if any, 
and the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 

Form number: ATF Form 5320.20. 
Component: Bureau of Alcohol, 

Tobacco, Firearms and Explosives, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 

4. Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: 

Primary: Individual or households. 
Other: None. 
Abstract: The information is used by 

ATF to determine the lawful 
transportation of an NFA firearm and/or 
to pursue the criminal investigation into 
an unregistered NFA firearm. 

5. An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: An estimated 7200 
respondents will take 20 minutes to 
complete the form. 

6. An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: The estimated annual public 
burden associated with this collection is 
2400 hours. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Jerri Murray, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE., Room 3E– 
405B, Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: November 25, 2014. 
Jerri Murray, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2014–28206 Filed 11–28–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–FY–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Notice of Lodging of Proposed 
Consent Decree Modification Under 
the Clean Water Act 

On November 21, 2014, the 
Department of Justice lodged a proposed 
Agreed Consent Decree Modification 
with the United States District Court for 
the Northern District of Indiana in the 
lawsuit entitled United States and State 
of Indiana v. The City of Fort Wayne, 
Indiana, Civil Action No. 2:07–cv– 
00445–PPS–APR. 

The United States and State of 
Indiana (State) previously filed a 
complaint against Fort Wayne for 
violations of the Clean Water Act, 33 
U.S.C. §1251 et seq., in connection with 
the City of Fort Wayne’s operation of its 
municipal wastewater and sewer 
system. On April 1, 2008, the Court 
entered a Consent Decree between the 
parties that required Fort Wayne to 
implement various injunctive measures 
to address its combined sewer overflows 
(CSOs) and sanitary sewer overflows 
(SSOs). Under the Consent Decree, the 
injunctive relief is to be implemented 
over an 18-year period and is designed 
to eliminate SSOs and reduce the 
number of CSOs to approximately one 
per year on the St. Joseph River and four 
per year on the St. Marys and Maumee 
Rivers. 

In the process of implementing the 
injunctive relief, Fort Wayne developed, 
and proposed to the regulators, an 
alternative remedy for CSOs 45, 51, 53, 
68, and 52, which discharge to the St. 
Joseph River. The alternative approach 
will achieve the same level of control as 
required by the Decree, but will cost less 
and be completed considerably sooner— 
by December 2015 instead of December 
2019. In addition, Fort Wayne is in the 
process of developing an alternative 
approach for CSO Control Measure 9 to 
address CSOs 54, 61, and 62, which 
discharge to the St. Marys and Maumee 
Rivers. The parties have agreed to revise 
the Consent Decree to allow Fort Wayne 
to propose a revised solution, subject to 
the regulators’ approval in accordance 
with a process set forth in the Decree, 
as long as any such proposal is 
submitted by December 15, 2016 and 
meets the Performance Criteria and 
Critical Milestones previously agreed to 
for Control Measure 9. Finally, the 
parties have agreed to correct a 
typographical error concerning CSO 
Control Measure 9. This Control 
Measure must be designed to achieve a 
Performance Criterion of 4 CSO events 
in a typical year as correctly set forth in 
Appendix 3, footnote 7, and not one 
overflow per year, as incorrectly set 
forth in the text box of Appendix 3 that 
describes CSO Control Measure 9. The 
proposed Agreed Consent Decree 
Modification incorporates all of these 
changes. 

The publication of this notice opens 
a period for public comment on the 
proposed Agreed Consent Decree 
Modification. Comments should be 
addressed to the Assistant Attorney 
General, Environment and Natural 
Resources Division, and should refer to 
United States and State of Indiana v. 
The City of Fort Wayne, Indiana, D.J. 
Ref. No. 90–5–1–1–07653. All 

comments must be submitted no later 
than thirty (30) days after the 
publication date of this notice. 
Comments may be submitted either by 
email or by mail: 

To submit 
comments: Send them to: 

By email ....... pubcomment-ees.enrd@
usdoj.gov. 

By mail ......... Assistant Attorney General, 
U.S. DOJ–ENRD, P.O. Box 
7611, Washington, DC 
20044–7611. 

During the public comment period, 
the proposed Agreed Consent Decree 
Modification may be examined and 
downloaded at this Justice Department 
Web site: http://www.usdoj.gov/enrd/
Consent_Decrees.html. We will provide 
a paper copy of the Agreed Consent 
Decree Modification upon written 
request and payment of reproduction 
costs. Please mail your request and 
payment to: Consent Decree Library, 
U.S. DOJ–ENRD, P.O. Box 7611, 
Washington, DC 20044–7611. 

Please enclose a check or money order 
for $8.50 (25 cents per page 
reproduction cost) payable to the United 
States Treasury. 

Randall M. Stone, 
Acting Assistant Section Chief, 
Environmental Enforcement Section, 
Environment and Natural Resources Division. 
[FR Doc. 2014–28203 Filed 11–28–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Office of the Secretary 

Notice of Publication of 2014 Update to 
the Department of Labor’s List of 
Goods Produced by Child Labor or 
Forced Labor 

AGENCY: Bureau of International Labor 
Affairs, Department of Labor. 
ACTION: Announcement of public 
availability of updated list of goods. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces the 
publication of an updated list of 
goods—along with countries of origin— 
that the Bureau of International Labor 
Affairs (ILAB) has reason to believe are 
produced by child labor or forced labor 
in violation of international standards 
(the List). ILAB is required to develop 
and make available to the public the List 
pursuant to the Trafficking Victims 
Protection Reauthorization Act (TVPRA) 
of 2005, as amended. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Director, Office of Child Labor, Forced 
Labor, and Human Trafficking, Bureau 
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